ORDINANCE 18-02
AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING
A SET OF CODE AMENDMENTS TO ORDINANCE 16-05 FOR THE WARRENVILLE
FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT,
DUPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

WHEREAS, The Warrenville Fire Protection District (The District), DuPage
County, llinois is a fire protection district duly incorporated under the laws of the State of
Ilinois, including the Fire Protection District Act (the “Act”, 70 ILCS 705/0.01 et seq.);

and

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the District (the “Board”) has full power
pursuant to Section 6 of the Act (70 ILCS 705/6) to pass necessary ordinances, and
rules and regulations for the proper management and conduct of the business of the
Board for carrying into effect objects for which the District was formed; and

WHEREAS, Section 11 of the Act (70 ILCS 705/1 1) empowers and makes it the
legal duty and obligation of the District's Board as nearly adequate protection from fire
for all persons and property within the District as possible to prescribe necessary
regulations for the prevention and control of fire therein; and

WHEREAS, the District's Board has the expressed power pursuant to section 11
of the Act (70 ILCS 705/11) to adopt and enforce fire prevention codes and standards
parallef to national standards to promote fire prevention; and

WHEREAS, the District is empowered by the Act to provide reasonable
safeguards through Fire Prevention Codes to protect the Public Health and Safety
against hazards of the buildings and structures; and

WHEREAS, Pursuant to said authority the Board adopted Ordinance 16-05 as on
November 16, 2016 entitied “AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING BUILDING AND FIRE
PREVENTION CODES FOR THE WARRENVILLE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT";

and

WHEREAS, the need has come to amend Ordinance 16-05 to add further
clarification and support to the original fire code ordinance.

§ 100. INCORPORATION

That the preambles to this Ordinance be and the same hereby are, incorporated herein
by this reference as if set out in full at this place.

§ 101. RULES OF CONSTRUCTION

The language of this Ordinance shall be interpreted in accordance with the following
rules of construction:

A. The singular number includes the plural number includes the singular;
B. The word “shall” is mandatory; the word “may” is permissive; and
C. The masculine gender includes the feminine and neuter.



§ 102. DEFINITIONS.

A Whenever the word “municipality” is used in this code, it means the Warrenville
Fire Protection District.

B. Whenever the term “fire code official’, “authority having jurisdiction”, or “fire
prevention bureau” is used in this code, it means the Fire Chief or his designee.

C. Whenever the term “department of building or fire” is used in this code, it means
the Fire Prevention Bureau of the Warrenville Fire Prevention Bureau.

D. Whenever the term “structure” or “building” is used in this code it shall have the
same meaning as defined in the ICC International Building Code — 2015 Edition.

§ 103. SHORT TITLE

This QOrdinance shall be known and cited as the “Fire and Building Code” and will be
referred to in this Ordinance as “the code” or the “building code.”

§ 104. Appeals

(a) An appeal may be taken to the Warrenville Fire Protection District by
applying to the Warrenville Fire Protection District Board by any person aggrieved, from
any order, requirement decision or determination made by the Fire Official or his/her
assigned designee. Such appeal shall be taken within 20 days of the action from which it
is taken by filing with the Fire Official, a notice of appeal, specifying the grounds thereof.
The Board shall thereupon set a reasonable time, date and place certain for a hearing of
said appeal, and shall cause written notice thereof to be mailed to the appealing party, or
his/her attorney, and to the Fire Official.

(b) The Board may reverse or affirm, wholly or partially, or may modify the
order, requirement decision or determination as in its opinion cught to be done or made
in the premises, and to that end shall have all the powers vested to the Fire Official by
this Ordinance.

(c) The vote of the majority of the members of the Board present shall be
necessary to reverse, in whole, or in part or to modify, any orders, requirements,
decisions or determinations of the Fire Official. The Board shall keep minutes of its
proceeding hereunder, showing the vote of each member upon every question, or if
absent or failing to vote, indicating such fact, and shall also keep records of its
examinations and other official acts.

{(d) All decisions of the Board hereunder shall be reduced to writing, filed with
the Clerk, and a copy thereof mailed to the appealing party and to the Fire Official.

(e) As used in this Ordinance the term Fire Official means the person or
corporation appointed by the President and approved by the Board of Trustees.



§ 105 Violations — penalties: remedies

(a) It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, construct,
alter, extend, repair, move, remove, demolish or occupy any building, structure or
equipment regulated by this code, or cause same to be done, in conflict with or in
violation of any of the provisions of this code.

(b)  The Fire Official is authorized to serve a notice of violation or order on the
person responsible for the erection, construction, alteration, extension, repair, moving,
removal, demolition or occupancy of a building or structure In violation of the provision
of this code, or in violation of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this
code. Such order shalll direct the discontinuance of the illegal action or condition and the
abatement of the violation.

(c) If the notice of violation is not complied with promptly, the Fire Official is
authorized to request the Board Attorney to institute the appropriate administrative
proceeding and/or proceeding at law or in equity to restrain, comrect or abate such
violation, or to require the removal, termination of the unlawful occupancy of the bullding
or structure in violation of this code or of the order or direction made pursuant thereto,
and to punish such violator in accordance herewith.

(d) Any person who violates, disobeys, omits, neglects or refuses to comply
with, or who resists the enforcement of any of the provisions of this ordinance, Including
provisions adopted by reference, or who refuses to remedy a violation of any such
provision or to remedy a hazard of fire, explosion, collapse, contagion, or spread of
infectious disease found to exist and duly ordered eliminated, shall be guilty of an
offense under this ordinance and shall pay a civil fine not to exceed $750. Each day’s
continuing violation shall constitute a separate offense. If it should become necessary
to institute legal action to enforce the provisions of this ordinance, or to restrain a
violation hereof; or to collect any fees imposed by the Fire Official hereunder, the Board,
in addition to the imposition of such remedy, shall be entitied to an award of all its costs
and expenses incurred in such action, including its reasonable attorney's fees.

(e) A person licensed or registered by the state, or a subdivision thereof, to do
work regulated by this ordinance or to render professional, architectural, or engineering
service in connection therewith, who violates the law or ordinance under license or
registration, or who violates the ordinance while carrying out such work or rendering
service In connection therewith, shall be reported to the Fire Official and to the licensing
authority.

i) Where a dispute arises regarding an engineering opinion fumished by the
owner of property involved in such manner covered by this ordinance, the Board may
engage the services of a qualified registered engineer and the owner of the property
involved by way of an increase in the application fee otherwise provided, shall reimburse
the Board for reasonable customary cost of such services. In the event the property
owner prevails, the District shall absorb costs pertaining to the engineering costs and
fees generated in such dispute.

§ 108 Stop work order



(a) Whenever the Fire Official finds any work regulated by the code being
performed without a permit or in a manner either contrary to the provisions of this code
or dangerous or unsafe, the Fire Official is authorized to issue a stop work order.

{b) The stop work order shall be in the form of a red-tag posted on the
bullding or property involved, or given to the owner's agent, or to the person doing the
work. Upon posting the red-tag the cited work shall immediately cease.

()] Any person who shall continue any work after the building or property has
been red-tagged, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a
violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to penalties prescribed in this ordinance.

§ 107 Plumbing in general

(a) Delete all references in all ICC codes to the International Plumbing Code and
insert the Illinois Plumbing Code.

§ 108 Other codes in general

(a) NFPA the following standards are adopted by reference and supersede the
editions listed in of the adopted codes
NFPA 13 — 2016 Standard for the installation of Sprinkler systems
NFPA 13R - 2016 Standard for the installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low
Rise Residential Occupancies
NFPA 13D - 2016 Standard for the Instaliation of Sprinkler Systems in One
and Two Family Dwellings
NFPA 101 — 2015 Life Safety Code
NFPA 72- 2016 National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code

(b) DuPage County Fire Prevention Code — 2015 edition

§ 109 Adoption of codes
ADOPTION OF CODES.

That the codes described and as set forth below in this section, three (3) copies of which
are on file in the offices of the Warrenville Fire Protection District, are hereby adopted as
the Building Code of the Warrenvilie Fire Protection District, in the State of lllinois, for the
control of buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and ali of the regulations,
provisions, penaities, conditions and terms of said Codes are hereby referred to, adopted
and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance with the additions, insertions,
deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in this Ordinance, excepting there from any
conflict with the Warrenville Fire Protection District fee schedule ordinance. The following
Codes are adopted:

1. International Building Code 2015 Edition
2. International Residential Code 2015 Edition
3. International Mechanical Code 2015 Edition
4. International Fuel Gas Code 2015 Edition
5. International Property Maintenance Code 2015 Edition



6. International Fire Code 2015 Edition
7. International Urban-Wildiand Interface 2015 Edition
Code
8. International Existing Building Code 2015 Edition
9. International Energy Conservation Code 2015 Edition
10. International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 2015 Edition
11. International Solar Energy Provisions 2015 Edition
12. National Electric Code 2014 Edition
13. lllinois Plumbing Code 2014 Edition
14. lllinois Accessibility Code 1997 Edition
168. NFPA 101 Life safety Code 2015 Edition

Code conflicts: When there is conflict between one of the adopted codes or the code and
referenced standards, the stricter of the requirements shall apply.

§ 110 ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

Chapter1: Adminlistration

The following sections are hereby revised as follows:

Section 101.1 Insert: “Warrenville Fire Protection District”

Section 105.1.7 Ingert: Permit Fees. Fees are per the applicable Warrenville Fire
Protection District, City of Warrenville, or DuPage County schedules.

Section 109.2 Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees
Section 112.2 See section 104 of this ordinance for Board membership.

Section 113.6 Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees
schedule.

Section 304.1.1.1 Insert: Waste Material. “No person shall store in any building

excess packing cases, wooden or plastic pallets, barrels, boxes, rubber tires, shavings,
excelsior, rubbish, paper bags, litter, hay, straw and similar combustibles. Aisle ways and
storage of the above mentioned combustibles necessary for the performance of business
shall be kept in an orderly and neat manor. Combustible materials shall be removed daily
or more often as necessary to suitable vaults, bins, dumpsters, compactors or separate
building. Such practices shall be approved by the code official.

Section 319 Insert: 319.1 Transportation. Routes for vehicles transporting
explosives, blasting agents, and combustible & flammable liquids shall be approved by
State and Federal goverments.

Section 503.2.4 Add: “Approved turning radius templates shall be shown on all
documental submittals.”



Section 503.4.2 Insert: Enforcement agreement required. Where required to ensure
enforcement of parking restrictions the building or property owner shall enter into an
enforcement agreement with the police department allowing issuance of cltations.

Saction 505.1 Add: Address numbers. Similar sized numbers and letters shall be
located at all rear and side doors of all multi-tenant commercial structures.

Section 506.1 Add: Where required. This rapid entry key box system shall be used
for Fire Department Emergencies only.

Section 507.5.1 Where required. Delete in its entirety including exceptions and
substitute the following;

Insert. Where required. Along public streets so that no portion of
the building or structure to be protected will be over three hundred (300) feet from any
required hydrant in multiple-housing, commercial, or industrial developments as measured
along approved route and four hundred (400) fest in residential districts. Where this may
not be possible, additional hydrants shall be located upon the premises accessible to
motorized fire apparatus.

Section 507.5.1.2  Insert: Distance to fire department connection (FDC).
No required FDC shall be located aver fifty (50) feet from a Fire Hydrant.

Section 507.5.1.3 Insert. Where required. At least two (2) hydrants shall be located
within three hundred (300) feet of each commercial or multifamily building.

Section 507.5.7 Insert: Design standard. Fire hydrants used in conjunction with
water supplies shall meet the standard of the American Water Works Association
Standard No. C-502, and shall have two (2) 2-1/2 inch and one (1) 4-1/2 inch outlets.
Threads shall be American National Standard. The 4-1/2 inch port shall face the roadway.
Each fire hydrant shall supply one thousand (1000) gpm, and where fire suppression
systems are served by the same main, the system requirement shall be added to the total
water supply requirement.

Section 903.2 Automatic sprinkiers where required: Delete 903.2 through
803.2.10.1 and replace as follows: Approved automatic
sprinklers systems shall be installed In all new building
groups, A,B,E,F-1,F-2,H,|,R (by amendment below), M,S-1,8-2
and group U exceeding 1,000 square feet.

All One and Two Family dwellings shall have a fire sprinkler system

when the following are applicable:

1. Lot size is less than 7,000 square fest and

2. When any part of the structure is two stories or greater or any
part of the roof structure is greater than 30 feet and has a lot
coverage of less than 33% as defined in The Warrenville Zoning
Ordinance. (High Density)

Section 903.2.13 Additions and remodeling in access of 50 percent of square
footage to existing bulldings. Add: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout existing buildings and new additions as listed above, when such



additions and or remodeling’s exceed 50 percent of the total square footage or a change
of use of occurs if new use is of an increased hazard.

Section 903.3.7 Fire Department Connections; Add: FDC's installed shall require
5 inch Storz fitting with 30 degree elbow.

Section 903.4 Add: Sprinkler system supervision and alarms. Exceptions: 2,
3,4,5,6, and 7 delete in their entirety.

Section 905.3.9 Add: All other buildings. Standpipes shall be installed in areas
where horizontal or vertical access is more than one hundred fifty (150) feet beyond the
level of the fire department vehicle access. Distance to be measured starting from the fire
department apparatus’ hose connection. These are required to be located at each exit
door on each floor.

SECTION 807. Fire Alarm and Detection Systems; Insert: Existing Fire alarms
systems must continue to be smoke activated in all use groups, in all structures over 1500
square feet. Smoke activated Fire Alarm systems will be instalied in common areas only.

Section 907.2 Where required; delete the first paragraph in its entirety and substitute
the following language;

New structures shall install an approved addressable contact point I.D. fire alarm system
in accordance of this code and NFPA 72, and provide occupant notification in accordance
with section 907.5. Fire Alarm system shall only include that necessary for required
operation and not include other components for security or burglar alarm functions. Alarm
to be monitored by a local licensed Central Station or Remote Station and dispatched by
approved AES/Keltron radio transmitter.

Section 907.2.1 Delete first paragraph and the exception in its entirety and substitute
the following language;

807.2.1. Group A, Group E, Group H, Group |, Group M, Group
R-1,R-2, . An automatic fire alarm detection system shall be installed and maintained in
all new occupancies.

Section 907.2.2 Delete the first paragraph and the exception in its entirety and

substitute the following language;
807.2.2 Group B. An automatic fire alarm detection system shall

be installed and maintained in all new occupancies over 500 Sq. Ft.

Section 907.2.4 807.2.4 Group F. Delete this paragraph in its entirety and substitute

the following language;
907.2.4 Group F,S, and U. An automatic fire alarm detection

system shall be installed and maintained in all new occupancies with a total gross building
area over 500 (Five Hundred) square feet.

Section 807.5 Insert. Tampering with the resetting of Fire Alarms. At no time
or incident will anyone besides Fire District personnel reset the Fire Alarm System during
an official Fire Alarm activation and could be subject to fines and or charges brought
against per state law.



Section 907.5.2.3.4 Insert. Audio Visible Alarms Tenant space .Each tenant space
in a multiple tenant building shall have an audio visual device in an outside public access
area indicating which tenant space has the activated alarm.

Section 907.5.2.3.5 Insert. Outside Water flow alerting Red Lens Visual device.
All fire alarm fire suppression systems shall provide a Red Lens Visual device mounted
over the required FDC for all water flow activations.

Section 907.6.6 Monitoring.  Delete the exceptions in their entirety.

Section 907.6.7 Insert: Installation and monitoring; Any current installed and
operating local fire alarm systems in all use groups must be properly monitored by a local,
licensed UL listed Central station or Remote Station.

Section 907.6.8 Insert: Existing building addItions and remodeling In access
of twenty five (25) percent. Add: All existing buildings regardless of use group shall
install an approved automatic fire detection system when additions or remodsling that
exceed twenty five (25) percent of the square footage of the building.

Section 907.9 Delete this section in its entirety and insert the following;

907.9. Where required in existing buildings and structures. An approved fire alarm
system complying with this chapter shall be maintained in all existing buildings and
structures currently protected, and provided in all new occupancies and structures as
required..

Section 5601.2 Permit Required.
Insert. §601.2.5. Flreworks; Shall follow the local requirements of the City of Warrenville
ordinance #2291 and the Warrenville Fire Prevention District ordinance #2008-03

IEBC section 101.8 Add: Fire Protection systems. The requirements for the fire
protection systems as outlined by any section of this code are superseded by the
requirements in the amendments to the International Building and Fire Codes for new and
existing buildings.

IEBC section 1401.5.4 Add: Sprinkler system requirements. The local sprinkler
system requirements including local amendments to the International Building and Fire
Codes shall apply regardless of the outcome of the performance compliance caiculations
from IEBC section 1401.6

Section 101.1 Insert the following: When there is a conflict between this Code and
the lllinois Accessibility Code, the stricter of the two requirements
shall be applied.

Section 1612.3 Insert Title 8, Chapter 5 DuPage County Storm water and
Floodplain Ordinance.

Section 3001.1.1 Insert the following: All rules, law and ordinances and amendments
by the lllinois Office of the State Fire Marshall shall be applicable.



Section 3301.3 Waste container. All demolition, new construction, room additions
and remodeling projects shall have a dumpster or container on site
which are adequate in size for the containment and disposal of ali
job site refuse. The dumpster or containers shall be emptied when
the wastes or trash exceeds the top edge of the container.

Appendices Adopt the following appendices D, H, |, J, K,

§ 111 ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

Chapter 1:  Administration

The following sections are hereby revised as follows:

Section R101.1 Ingert: “Warrenville Fire Protection District”

Section R108.2 Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees
schedule.

Section R112.1 See saction 104 of this ordinance for Board membership.

Section R113.4 Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees
schedule.

Section 114.1 Add the following: See section 104 of this ordinance for additional

Requirements.

Section 301.2(1) Design Criteria

| Ground Snow Load | 25 ——
Wind Speed (mph) | 3 second 90 normal 75 :
Topographic Effects ' No o ;
_Seismic Design Category C ‘
' Special wind region | No ]
Wind-bome debris zone No -
Seismic Design Category | A
| Weathering Severe
'Frost line depth 42 inches |
Termlte | Moderate to heavy -
Wlnter Design Temperature -4 degrees
Ice Shield Underlayment Yes B
| Flood Hazard See DuPage County Storm water Ordinance
| Air Freezing Index 2000 -

| Mean Annual Temperature | 50 degrees




Section 313.2
Chapters 25 — 32 delete the Chapters in their entirety.
Appendices Adopt the following appendices J.

§ 112 ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

Chapter 1:  Administration
The following sections are hereby revised as follows:
Section 101.1 Insert: "Warrenville Fire Protection District”

Section 106.5.2 / 106.5.3
Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees
schedule.

Section 108.4/108.5
Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fee
schedule.

Section 109 Delete 109.2 and see section 104 of this ordinance for Board
membership.

§ 113 ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE
INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE

Chapter 1: Administration
The following sections are hereby revised as follows:
Section 101.1 Insert: “Warrenville Fire Protection District’

Section 106.5.2/ 106.5.3
Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees

schedule.

Section 108.4/108.5
Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fee
schedule.

Section 109 Delete 109.2 and see section 104 of this ordinance for Board
membership.

§ 114 ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

10



Chapter1: Administration

The following sections are hereby revised as follows:

Section 101.1
Section 103.5
Section 106.4
Section 111.2

Section 112.4

§ 115 ADDITIONS,

Insert: “Warrenville Fire Protection District”
See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fee scheduie.
See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fee schedule.

Delete the section and insert see section 104 of this ordinance for
Board membership.

See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fee schedule.

INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

Chapter 1: Administration

The following sections are hereby revised as follows;

Section 101.1
Section 104.1
Section 108.3

Section 109.4

Section 111.4

Section 114.4

Section 1103.5.3
Section 5704.2.9.6.1

Section 5706.2.4.4

Section 5806.2
Section 6104.2

Appendices

Insert: “Warrenville Fire Protection District”
Fire Code Official is defined as the Fire Chief or his designee.
See section 104 of this ordinance for Board membership.

Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees
schedule.

Add the following: See District amendment 2004-02 of this
ordinance for additional requirements.

Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees
schedule.

Insert the date of adoption.

See the Warrenville Zoning Ordinance for the requirements.
See the Warrenville Zoning Ordinance for the requirements.
See the Warrenville Zoning Ordinance for the requirements.
See the Warrenville Zoning Ordinance for the requirements.

Adopt the following appendices B, C,D,E, F, G, H, |, J, K, M.

11



§116 ADDITIONS,

INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE

INTERNATIONAL URBAN-WILDLAND INTERFACE CODE

Chapter 1: Administration

The following sections are hereby revised as follows:

Section 101.1
Section 103.1
Section 106.1

Section 109.4.7

Section 112.1

§ 117 ADDITIONS,

Insert: “"Warrenville Fire Protection District’
Insert Fire Prevention Bureau.

Delete 109.2 and see section 404 of this ordinance for Board
membership.

Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection fee
schedule.

Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fee
schedule.

INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE

INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE

Chapter1: Administration

The following sections are hereby revised as follows:

Section 101.1
Section 108.2
schedule.

Section 112.3

Section 113.4

Section 1406.1

§ 118 ADDITIONS,

Insert: “Warrenville Fire Protection District”

Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees

Delete 109.2 and see section 104 of this ordinance for Board
membership.

Add the following: See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fee
schedule.

Add the following: Regardless of the outcome of this, it will not

change the automatic sprinkler requirements outlined in the
Building Cede, Fire Code or the amendments in this Ordinance.

INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE

INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL SAND SPA CODE

The following sections are hereby revised as follows:

Section 101.1

Insert: “Warrenville Fire Protection District”

12



Section 105.6.2/ 105.6.3

See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees schedule.

Section 107.4 See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees schedule.

Section 107.5 See the Warrenville Fire Protection District fees schedule

Section 108.2 Delete 108.2 and see section 104 of this ordinance for Board
membership.

§ 119 ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE
INTERNATIONAL SOLAR ENERGY PROVISIONS

There are no additions, insertions or changes to the International Solar Energy
Provisions...

§ 120 ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE NATIONAL
ELETRIC CODE

There are no additions, insertions or changes to the National Electric Code.

§ 121 ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE ILLINOIS
PLUMBING CODE

There are no additions, insertions or changes to the lllinois Plumbing Code.

§ 122 ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE ILLINOIS
ACCESSIBILITY CODE

There are no additions, insertions or changes to the Illinois Accessibility Code. Any
conflicts between this State Code and Chapter 11 of the International Building Code shall
have the stricter of the two requirements enforced.

§ 123 ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETIONS AND CHANGES TO THE NFPA 101 -
LIFE SAFETY CODE

See the International Residential Code for the requirements for automatic fire sprinklers
in one and two-family dwellings.

§ 124 BUILDING CONSTRUCTION HOURS OF OPERATION.
Construction or alteration operations shall not be carried on prior to 7:00 AM or later than

7:00 PM Monday through Saturday and not carried on prior to 10:00 AM and no later than
6 PM on Sundays and holidays, unless approved in writing by the Building Official.

13



§ 125 REPEALER

All Ordinances of the Warrenville Fire Protection District inconsistent herewith, to the
extent of such inconsistency and no further, are hereby repealed upon the effective date
hereof.

§ 126 SEVERABILITY

Should any section, subsection or other provision of this ordinance for any reason to be
held invalid or unconstitutional by the decision of any court of competent jurisdiction, such
decision shall not affect the validity of the Ordinance as a whole or any part not declared
invalid.

§ 127 SAVINGS CLAUSE

That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Codes hereby adopted shall be construe to affect
any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred,
or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under ant act or ordinance hereby
repealed as cited in Section 5; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character
be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance.

§ 128 EFFECTIVE DATE

That this Ordinance 18-02 shall be in fult force and effect from and after its passage,
approval, and publication to pamphlet form and following completion of all other
publication requirements as provided by law.

AYES: 5
NAYS: S
ABSENT: <)
HA
PASSED and APPROVED this ,(D day of M [le[,._ , 2018.
{
= 4 e
E ,f;}_f/d* r:’;!/-p(."'ﬂ_'__——';;-— =
KatHleen Perkins
President
~ATFEST,,
~Jeff Calfreris

Seirh

14



